
This training centre of the Indian Army is a matter of pride for all of
us and the aim of this centre is to transform the defenders of our
great nation into physically fit, mentally robust and professionally
competent soldiers.  

Our team installed a volleyball court using TigerTurf Championship
40 which is made using our unique rhomboid shaped fibres that
remain upright giving consistent playing performance. When
compressed, these fibres twist rather than bending so they
continue to bounce back upright, making the surface perfect for
high utlisation fields. Not only that, this product is also FIFA Quality
and FIFA Quality Pro certified.

Indian Army
Shillong, Meghalaya

Supply and installation of TigerTurf Championship 40 for volleyball
court & acrylic surface for a tennis-cum-basketball court.

Date of project completion: November, 2023

Surface: TigerTurf Championship 40 for volleyball & ITF certified 8
layers acrylic system for tennis & basketball 

We also installed an ITF certified 8 layer, acrylic court for both
basketball and tennis using different coloured line markings (white
for tennis and yellow for basketball). This acrylic surface is
manufactured from premium quality resins and an overall good
value in terms of investment. 

The client was so satisfied with our project execution that they gave
an appreciation letter as well during the site handover. In the words
of the client:
“It is certified that Shri Eeshwar Chauhan of Altius Sports & Leisure
Private Limited single handedly executed an 8 layer synthetic
basketball and tennis court of very high quality and standards at
our Training Centre (Altius Sports is not mentioning name and
location owing to security reasons). He has worked in these
challenging climatic conditions with sincerity and dedication.This
certificate is an appreciation of his professional competence and
dedication to the  company”.


